
1 ADULTICIDE 

Liquid concentrate to contains 9. 9 pounds 

of Malathion per gallon (96.5% by weight ofactive ingredient) 

With current approval in Texas for ground and aerial 

application. QUANTITIES OF 3000 GALLONS OR LESS BULK ONLY 

2 ADULTICIDE 

Liquid concentrate to contains 9.9 pounds 

of Malathion per gallon (96.5% by weight of active ingredient) 

With currenl_approval in Texas for ground and aerial 

application. QUANTITIES IN EXCESS OF 3000 GALLONS BULK ONLY 

3 ADULTICIDE 

Liquid concentrate to contain 9.9 pounds 

of Malathion per gallon (96.5% by weight ofactive ingredient) 

With current approval in Texas for ground and aerial 

application. MINI-BULK CONTAINERS, 260 GALLON TOTES 

4 ADULTICIDE, QUICK KILL 
Oil Base, High Potency concentrate containing 

2. 86 pounds of Permethrin (3 I. 15% by weight of active 

ingredient) and 6.13 pounds of Technical Piperonyl Butoxide 

(66.85% by weight active Ingredient) with current approvarfor ground 

application in Texas. 30 GALLON DRUM CONTAINERS 

IFB-INSECTICIDES 

JULY 11, 2023-JULY 10, 2024 

CLARKE MOSQUITO 

PRODUCTS, INC 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

155.12/GL 

30 GALLON DRUM 

ADAPCO, LLC 

NO BID 

NO BID 

$78.68/GL 

1-3 260 GL TOTES 

$78.68/GL OR 

$20.456.80/TOTE 

4 + 260GL TOTES $ 

77.66/GLOR 

$20,191.60/TOTE 

260 GALLON TOTE 

FYFANON ULV 

INSECTICIDE 

MALATHION· 

160.00/GL 

30 GALLON DRUM 

TARGET SPECIALTY 

PRODUCTS 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

$119.00 

30 GALLON' DRUM 

VESERIS 

$63.99/GL 

BULK 

FYFANON 

$63.99/GL 

BULK 

FYFANON 

NO BID 

$149.99/GL 

30 GALLON DRUM 

CENTRAL LIFE SCIENCES PERMASEASE PERMANONE 31-66 PERMX 31-66 

PERM-X 31-66 

PermaSease31-67 

Permethrin 31.15% 

PBO 66.85% 

Alternate: 

PermaSease 30-30 

Unit Price:$ 
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IFB-INSECTICIDES 

JULY 11, 2023-JULV 10, 2024 

5 ADULTICIDE, QUICK KILL 

Oil Base, High Potency concentrate containing 

0.74 pounds of Technical Sumithrin/gallon · (10% by weight of 

active ingredient) and 0.74 pounds of Technical Piperonyl Butoxide/gallon 

( I 0% by weight of active ingredient) with current approval for ground 

application in Texas. , 
30 GALLON DRUM CONTAINERS 

6 ADULTICIDE, QUICK KILL 

Oil Base, High Potency concentrate containing 

0.071 pounds of Technical Pra!lethrin per gallon (1.00% by weight of active 

ingredient), 0.35 pounds of Technical Sumithrin per gallon (5.00 % by weight 

of active ingredient), and 0.35 pounds Technical Piperonyl Butoxide per gallon 

(5.00 % by weight of active ingredient) with current approval for ground 

application in Texas. 30 GALLON DRUM CONTAINERS 

7 LARVICIDE 

Coconut Oil based surface film. Must have current approval for use in the State of Texas 
for aquatic mosquito larval control. QUANTITY OF 1000 GALLONS BULK 

$255.00 

30 GALLON DRUM 

CLARKE 

ANVILl0+lO 

$192.00/GL 

30 GALLON DRUM 

CLARKE 

DUET 

$44.00/GL 

NO BID NOBID 

NOBID NO BID 

19.33/GL $15.92/GL 

SHIPMENTS AND MINI-BULK CONTAINERS-275 GALLON TOTES ONLY. MINIUM 1000 GALLONS 275 GALLON TOTE 275 GALLON TOTE 

8. LARVICIDE 

Larvicide, Water Soluble Pouches to contain Spinosad (a mixture ofspiriosyn A and 
spinosyn D) 2.5% active ingredient. 97.5% other ingredient. 

Must have current approval- for use in the State of Texas for aquatic mosquito 

control. QUANTITY OF 400 WATER SOLUBLE POUCHES PER CASE 

9 LARVICIDE 

Larvicide, Water Soluble Pouches to contain Bacillus sphaericus 2362, Serotype H5a5b, 
strain ABTS 1743 Technical Powder (670 BslTU/mg) 7.5% active ingredient. 92.5% 
other ingredients. Must have current approval for use in the State of Texas for aquatic 
mosquito larval control. QUANTITY OF 800 WATER SOLUBLE POUCHES PER 
CASE. 

CLARKE 

COCOBEAR 

$450/CASE 

500 COUNT CASE 

CLARKE-

NATUl:AR G3Q WSP 

NOBID-

BVA2 

Alternate-BVA2 

Mosquito Larvide 

Oil 

BVA 

BVA-2 Larvicide Oil 

NO BID $646.10/CASE 

$875/CASE. 

800 WSP/CASE 

VECTOl:.EX WSP 

CASE OF 400 WATER 

SUMILARV 

SUMILARV O.SG WSP 

$768.00/CASE 

Case of 800 water soluble 

pouches 

Altosid 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

Nb BID 



IFB-INSECTICIDES 
JULY 11, 2023-JULY 10, 2024 

10 LARVICIDE 

Larvicide, Briquets to contain (S) - Methoprene (CAS # 65733-16-6) 
(Dry Weight) 8.62% active ingredient 91.38% other ingredients. Must have 

current approval for use in the State of Texas for aquatic mosquito larval control. 
QUANTITY OF 400 BRIQUETS PER CONTAINER 

11 LARVICIDE 

Larvicide, Briquets to contain (S) - Methoprene (CAS # 65733-16-6) 
(Dry Weight Basis) 2.1 % active ingredient. 97.9% other ingredients. Must have current 
approval for use in the State of Texas for aquatic mosquito larval control. 

$520.00/CONTAINER 

400 COUNT CASE 

CENTRAL LIFE SCIENCE 
ALTOSID 30 DAY 
BRIQUETS 

$818.40/CONTAINER 

QUANTITY OF 220 BRIQUETS PER CONTAINER 220 COUNT CASE 

12 LARVICIDE 

Larvicide; Briquets to contain Bacillus thuringiensis subspecies israelensis Strain BMP' 
144 (7% active ingredient, 93% other Ingredients). 

Must have current approval for use in State of Texas for aquatic mosquito larval control. 

CENTRAL LIFE SCIENCE 

Altosid XR 

$320/CASE 

200 COUNT CASE 

45 DAY BRIQUETS, QUANTITY OF 200 BRIQUETS PER CASE CENTRAL LIFE SCIENCE 

FOURSTAR Bti-45 day 

Alternate: Vectolex 
WSP Bacillus 
Sphaericus 2362, 
Strain ABTS-1743 

NO BID 

NOBID 

$1,475/CASE 

800 WATER 
SOLUBLE Pouches 

Altosid Pellet WSP 

$520/CONTAINER 

CASE OF 400 BRIQUETS 

ALTOSID 

ALTOSID 30 DAY BRIQUETS 

$818.40/CONTAIN ER 

CASE OF 200 BRIQUETS 

ALTOSID 

ALTOSID XR 150 Day 
Briquets 

$108.00/CASE 

Per Case CASE OF 100 BRIQUETS 

Vectomax WSP 
OMRI Certified 

Alternate: 
Vectomax wsp· (Bs 

Strain ABTS-1743 
and Bti Strain 
AMGS-52) Please 
note Alternate: 

SUMMIT 

2.7% Bs; 4.5% Bti SUMMIT BTI BRIQl:JlcTS 

$520.00/CONTAINER 

CASE OF 400 

ALTOSID 30 DAY 

$818.40/CONTAINER 

CASE 

ALTOSID XR BRIQUETS 

NOBID 



IFB-INSECTICIDES 

JULY 11, 2023-JULV 10, 2024 

13 INSECTICIDE DILUENT OIL 

Diluent oil used to dilute insecticide, including ULV application, where the insecticide 
label permits dilution with mineral oil or other petroleum hydrocarbon. Must have current 
approval for use in the State of Texas as an insecticide diluent. 

55 GALLON DRUM CONTAINERS 

$21.59 

55 GALLON DRUM 

CLARKE 

ENVIROTECH 

$18.98 $14.50 $12.99/GL 

55 GALLON DRUM 

BVA OR CALPAR 55 GALLON DBUM DRUM 

BVA13 OR CALPAR BVA 

BVA-13 DILUENT OIL MAXPORG260 


